

## BID FORM

Bids must be returned to Sabine County Judge's Office, 201 Main Street, Hemphill, TX by December 2, 2025

### SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FOR ROAD MATERIAL OBTAINED ON SITE:

Site Location of material: Rebecca Yard, 8670 State Hwy 103E, Bronson/Jasper Plant, 1045 E Milam, Jasper

<u>Glauconite Road Base (3 x 5):</u>	\$	No bid	ton	No bid	yard	
<u>Glauconite Rock :</u>	\$	No bid	ton	No bid	yard	
_____ :	\$		ton		yard	
_____ :	\$		ton		yard	
_____ :	\$		ton		yard	
<u>Limestone Base :</u>	\$	41.00	ton	N/A	yard	FOB Rebecca Yard
<u>Filter Rock (2 x 4):(1X3)</u>	\$	54.00	ton	N/A	yard	FOB Rebecca Yard
<u>Rip-Rap (4 x 6):(3X5)</u>	\$	54.00	ton	N/A	yard	FOB Rebecca Yard
_____ :	\$		ton		yard	
<u>Oil Sand :</u>	\$	79.00	ton	N/A	yard	FOB Jasper Plant
<u>Hot Mixed Asphalt</u>	\$	115.00	ton			FOB Jasper Plant
_____ :	\$		ton			
<u>Cold Laid Asphalt</u>	\$	110.00	ton			FOB Jasper Plant
_____ :	\$		ton			

ALL MATERIALS USED IN EACH PRODUCT MUST COMPLY WITH STATE & FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL LAWS AND REGULATIONS.

SABINE COUNTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICULAR QUANTITY OF PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD.

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every invoice. Any and all proposals shall be provided on this sheet.

*Sabine County reserves the right to accept or reject any or all proposals.*

DATE: 12/1/2025

FIRM: Texas Materials-East Texas

NAME: Josh Ridings

ADDRESS: 920 West Frank

PHONE NUMBER: 936-208-9952

Lufkin, Texas 75904

Approved 

Rejected \_\_\_\_\_

Bidder Initial JK



## BID FORM

Bids must be returned to Sabine County Judge's Office, 201 Main Street, Hemphill, TX by December 2, 2025

### SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FOR ROAD MATERIAL OBTAINED ON SITE:

#### Site Location of material:

<u>Glauconite Road Base (3 x 5):</u>	\$ <u>17.50</u> ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>Glauconite Rock : Base</u>	\$ <u>11.50</u> ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>1/2" Filter :</u>	\$ <u>17.50</u> ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>1" Filter :</u>	\$ <u>17.50</u> ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>2" Filter :</u>	\$ <u>17.50</u> ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>Limestone Base :</u>	\$ _____ ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>Filter Rock ( 2 x 4):</u>	\$ _____ ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>Rip-Rap ( 4 x 6):</u>	\$ _____ ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>Glauconite 2x4 :</u>	\$ <u>17.50</u> ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>Glauconite 5x8 :</u>	\$ <u>17.50</u> ton	<u>yard</u>
<u>Hot Mixed Asphalt</u>	\$ _____ ton	
_____	\$ _____ ton	
<u>Cold Laid Asphalt</u>	\$ _____ ton	
_____	\$ _____ ton	

ALL MATERIALS USED IN EACH PRODUCT MUST COMPLY WITH STATE & FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL LAWS AND REGULATIONS.

SABINE COUNTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICULAR QUANTITY OF PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD.

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every invoice. Any and all proposals shall be provided on this sheet.

*Sabine County reserves the right to accept or reject any or all proposals.*

DATE: 11/21/25 FIRM: Attoyac Rock, LLC  
NAME: Nico Birdwell ADDRESS: P.O. Box 482  
PHONE NUMBER: 936-275-6708 San Augustine, TX 75972

Approved X Rejected \_\_\_\_\_

Bidder Initial NB

D. J. Melton

VOL 4-F PG 790

## BID FORM

Bids must be returned to Sabine County Judge's Office, 201 Main Street, Hemphill, TX by December 2, 2025

### SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FOR ROAD MATERIAL OBTAINED ON SITE:

#### Site Location of material:

<u>Glauconite Road Base (3 x 5):</u>	<u>\$ 16.50</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>Glauconite Rock :</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>1" to 2" w/ fines Base</u>	<u>\$ 12.00</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>_____ :</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>_____ :</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>Limestone Base :</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>Filter Rock (2 x 4):</u>	<u>\$ 16.50</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>Rip-Rap (4 x 6):</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>6" and over :</u>	<u>\$ 28.50</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>_____ :</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>yard</u>
<u>Hot Mixed Asphalt</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>_____</u>
<u>_____</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>_____</u>
<u>Cold Laid Asphalt</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>_____</u>
<u>_____</u>	<u>\$</u>	<u>ton</u>	<u>_____</u>

ALL MATERIALS USED IN EACH PRODUCT MUST COMPLY WITH STATE & FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL LAWS AND REGULATIONS.

SABINE COUNTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICULAR QUANTITY OF PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD.

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every invoice. Any and all proposals shall be provided on this sheet.

***Sabine County reserves the right to accept or reject any or all proposals.***

DATE: 11/14/25 FIRM: Big 4, Inc.  
NAME: Melvin Munguia ADDRESS: 301 Worth Street  
PHONE NUMBER: 409-787-2733 Hemphill, TX 75948

Approved X Rejected \_\_\_\_\_

Bidder Initial mm

# BID FORM

**Bids must be returned to Sabine County Judge's Office, 201 Main Street, Hemphill, TX by December 2, 2025**

**SPECIFICATIONS AND PROPOSAL FOR ROAD MATERIAL OBTAINED ON SITE:**

**Site Location of material:**

<u>Glauconite Road Base (3 x 5) :</u>	\$ <u>17<sup>50</sup>/</u> ton	<u>-</u> yard
<u>Glauconite Rock :</u>	\$ _____ ton	_____ yard
<u>2" Base :</u>	\$ <u>12<sup>50</sup>/</u> ton	<u>-</u> yard
<u>(2x4) :</u>	\$ <u>17<sup>50</sup>/</u> ton	<u>-</u> yard
_____ :	\$ _____ ton	_____ yard
<u>Limestone Base :</u>	\$ _____ ton	_____ yard
<u>Filter Rock (2 x 4):</u>	\$ _____ ton	_____ yard
<u>Rip-Rap (4 x 6):</u>	\$ _____ ton	_____ yard
_____ :	\$ _____ ton	_____ yard
_____ :	\$ _____ ton	_____ yard
<u>Hot Mixed Asphalt</u>	\$ _____ ton	_____
_____	\$ _____ ton	_____
<u>Cold Laid Asphalt</u>	\$ _____ ton	_____
_____	\$ _____ ton	_____

ALL MATERIALS USED IN EACH PRODUCT MUST COMPLY WITH STATE & FEDERAL ENVIRONMENTAL LAWS AND REGULATIONS.

SABINE COUNTY WILL NOT BE OBLIGATED TO PURCHASE ANY PARTICULAR QUANTITY OF PRODUCT DURING THE BID PERIOD.

Certified weight tickets indicating gross weight on each load must be provided with every invoice. Any and all proposals shall be provided on this sheet.

*Sabine County reserves the right to accept or reject any or all proposals.*

DATE: 12-1-25 FIRM: JACK ALEXANDER LTD  
NAME: JIM ALEXANDER ADDRESS: PO. BOX 150338  
PRES. HUFKIN, TX 75915  
PHONE NUMBER: 936-676-8000  
936-632-3634

Approved ☒ Rejected ☐

Bidder Initial